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MADISON COUNTY
EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY

Butch Hammack, Director ® bhammack@madison-co.com
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DATE: December 2, 2014
TO: Madison County Board of Supervisors
RE: Road Claim for Yulonda Davis on Gluckstadt Road

The original investigation of this claim found a pothole in the vicinity of the location given by
Yulonda Davis. That particular pothole had been repaired. That pothole was in the general
area of 173 Gluckstadt Road. That pothole had been repaired recently but the date is
unknown. During the investigation on the above referenced claim, and other previous claims,
it was found that there were multiple potholes in the area on Gluckstadt Road between Hwy
463 and Dewees Road. It was not possible to ascertain which one was the one in question
after the seven days had run due to the fact that that area had been under consistent pothole
repair. That area has been the subject of several road claims and road repairs in the last several
weeks. Therefore, it is the recommendation of the Emergency Management Office to approve
and pay the claim to the order of Yulonda Davis in the amount of $373.42 (the lesser of the
two attached quotes) for stated repairs. If any further information is needed, please contact our
office.

Butch HammackArector
Madison County Emergency Management

601-859-4188 ® Fax: 601-859-4743 ® 125 West North Street ® Post Office Box 608 ® Canton, Mississippi 39046



ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT

Personal

Information

Date: [///0” /4

Name: g&/z)ﬁda ﬁfm’s

Mailing Address:
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Contact #: O] P~ ~43/

Make/ Model of Venicle: 74 Lexts L5700

“Incident

Information

lease answer questions below in relations tothe incident being
reported:

Date: //‘“ 0?" /L/ Time: Q,OO ,ﬂi’ﬂ
Location: é’l‘z{dkcﬁlﬁ:[’ Rd

(name of road incident occurred)

Approx. Speed at time of incident: 35’ % /71!’1\»
Direction of Travel: I}’Qﬂd,na [ﬂ&l’ on Lhdkjk}/ed
Cause of Incident: 0 + /l()/é

(ie: pothole, rock, etc..)

Area of vehicle damaged: hl[,k/ Pﬁﬂﬁﬁ/ _l-'/@ @JW

Incident

Summary

Please write a brief summary of the 1nc1dent (u ack if needed):
1 was dacling frst on Gludksad Drvi (
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Date Received:

OFFICE USE ONLY:

Received by: Dept:

Area Landmarks: # ;[éw [z(//’ fy&n /13 0/1/ &/ 7@@5} a}‘l’ﬂl Ferce




Big 10 Tire & Accessories

712 South State Street, Jackson, MS 39201
Phone: (601) 353-5461
www.big10tiresms.com

"Street Smart Since 1952"

Fax: (601) 948-6806

Quote #351828

Customer Information Quote Additional Information
YULONDA DAVIS Date: 11/10/2014 PO Number:
Reference: Q-351828 Work Order#:
Salesperson: Monica Davis Waiting: NO
Acct Number: 6019414310 Status:
Route:
Delivery Date:11/10/2014 Entered By: Monica Davis
Qty | Description Unit Price | Ext. Price
1.00 VZ310, P245/35ZR20 95W, Crusade HP BW XL, Venezia UHP 109.99 109.99
1.00 Mount & Balance - Aftermarket 29.99 29.99
1.00 Warehouse Tire Fee 1.00 1.00
1.00 Tire Disposal Fee 4.00 4.00
1.00 20" TYFUN 703S WHEEL 239.99 239.99
1.00 Frieght 25.00 25.00
Taxable 8% | Subtotal: 409.97 |
State Sales Tax 8%: 32.80
Terms: N/A | Total: $442.77 |
Parts Labor Subtotal Taxes\Fees FET Total
$349.98 $59.99 $409.97 $32.80 $0.00 $442.77

" Thank You for your Business "

| hereby authorize the stated repair work to be done along with the necessary material, and hereby grant Big 10 Tire & Accessories permission to
operate the vehicle herein described on streets, highways or elsewhere for the purpose of testing and/or inspection. An express mechanic's lien is
hereby acknowledged on above vehicle to secure the amount of repairs thereto. Big 10 Tire & Accessories is not responsible for loss or damage to

vehicles, or articles left in vehicles, in case of fire, theft or any other cause beyond it's control.
PLEASE READ - Tighten lugs 25 miles after service, no refunds on special order items (‘exch

restocking fee )

Expiration Date: 5/09/2015
11/10/2014 1:40 PM Page:

Entered By:

Monica Davis Signature

ange on manager's approval, méy be subject to a 25%
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Steven’s Tire & Rims
769-798-3355
923 Jenkins St.
Pearl, MS 39208
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Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 2:28 PM

To: Helen Keller; 'Shirley Brown’

Subject: FW: Pot hole on Gludkstat rd

Attachments: photo 1.JPG; ATT00003.txt; photo 2.JPG; ATT00004.txt

Please see attached photo. We have a claim we received today. Located approx. about a mile up from 463.

From: Yulonda Davis [mailto:mrsyrjd@me.com]
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 9:29 AM
To: Jennifer Taylor

Subject: Pot hole on Gludkstat rd



Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Monday, November 17, 2014 9:32 AM

To: Helen Keller; 'Shirley Brown'

Cc: Michael Gober (Michael.Gober@madison-co.com)
Subject: FW: Pot hole on Gludkstat rd

Attachments: photo 1.JPG; ATT00003.txt; photo 2.JPG; ATTO0004.txt

UPDATE on this claim sent over 11/10....

[ have a little better scope on this area. It is located near the mailbox of 173 and 217 near the wood fence.
The 7 day period on this is 11/20. Please advise of repairs made.

Thank you.

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 2:28 PM
To: Helen Keller; 'Shirley Brown’

Subject: FW: Pot hole on Gludkstat rd

Please see attached photo. We have a claim we received today. Located approx. about a mile up from 463.

From: Yulonda Davis [mailto:mrsyrjd@me.com]
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 9:29 AM
To: Jennifer Taylor )

Subject: Pot hole on Gludkstat rd



Michael Gober

Subject: FW: Claim status

From: Yulonda <yulonda d@yahoo.com>
Date: December 1, 2014 at 2:47:12 PM CST
To: <jennifer.taylor@madison-co.com>
Subject: Claim status

Hello Jennifer. I've learned that your off on medical leave.. I pray you are doing well.. I'm sorry
to bother you, but I can't get any information about my claim.. I brought estimates and damage
summary in on November 12, 2014. November 21,2014 was 7days from date I turned it in, and
the pothole was not fixed as of this date. I came to your office on Tuesday November 26, 2014. I
spoke with a young lady sorry I don't remember her name. She told me she had mailed a letter
out to me and she would have someone call me when they got back from lunch.. It is now
December 1, 2014 and have not received a phone call or letter from anyone in your office. I'm a
tax paying citizen as well, and I need to know what's going on with my claim please. I need my
vehicle to transport to and from work, and due to The damages occurred to my tire I'm taking a
risk riding on my only spare tire, because I can't afford to get it fixed as of yet.. Will you please
check on this for me and get back with me asap.. I will greatly appreciate it.. Thank you in
advance.

Yulonda Davis

Concerned citizen

Sent from my iPhone



